
  Boone County Purchasing 
 

  Liz Palazzolo            5551 S. Tom Bass Road, Room 204 
  Senior Buyer                 Columbia, MO 65201 

                           Phone: (573) 886-4392 
  Fax: (573) 886-4390    

         
________________________________________________________________ 

 
MEMORANDUM 

 
TO:  Boone County Commission 
FROM:  Liz Palazzolo, CPPO, C.P.M. 
DATE:   April 25, 2024 
RE: Award of Contract C000783 from RFP 05-13MAR24 for Detainee Medical 

Services for the Boone County Jail/Boone County Sheriff - Term and Supply  
 
 
Purchasing requests approval of Contract C000783 that results from Request for Proposal 05-
13MAR24.  Said RFP solicited proposals for Detainee Medical Services for the Boone County 
Jail.  Four proposals and one “No bid” were received: 
 
(1)  Advanced Correctional Healthcare of Franklin, Tennessee 
(2) Turn Key Health Clinics LLC of Oklahoma City, Oklahoma 
(3) Vital Medical Services of Glendale, California 
(4) Superior Blessings LLC of Columbia, Missouri 
(5) Southern Health Partners of Chattanooga, Tennessee (No Bid) 
 
The four proposals have been reviewed by an Evaluation Team that consists of the following 
personnel:  Captain Damon Reynolds, Boone County Jail Administrator; Captain Brian Leer of 
the Boone County Sheriff’s Office; Captain Jenny Atwell, Assistant Boone County Jail 
Administrator; and Leasa Quick, Budget Administrator for the Boone County Sheriff’s Office.  
The Purchasing Department chaired two evaluations meetings with the Evaluation Team and 
conducted two rounds of negotiations. 
 
After the first evaluation meeting, the Evaluation Team decided to short-list and removed two 
proposals from consideration.  The reasoning is documented in the attached memo.  Advanced 
Correctional Healthcare and Turn Key Health Clinics LLC were invited to submit a first round of 
Best and Final Offers (BAFOs).  These BAFOs were reviewed during the second Evaluation 
Team meeting which resulted in the decision to pursue a second BAFO with Turn Key Health 
Clinics LLC.  The attached Evaluation Narrative describes the evaluation and scoring between 
Advanced Correctional Healthcare and Turn Key Health Clinics, LLC. 
 
Weighted evaluation was used to evaluate and score the two proposals:  Experience, Expertise, 
and Reliability was worth a maximum score of 30 subjective points; and Method of Performance 
and Contractor Support was worth a maximum score of 20 subjective points.  Cost points, worth a 
maximum 50 points, were computed by the Purchasing Department.   
 

 



The Scoring Form, Evaluation Narrative explaining the subjective scores, and the Cost Evaluation 
are attached to this memo.  It is noted for the record that the Evaluation team scored subjective 
points, worth a maximum of 50 total points, without knowledge of cost point scores. 
 
The outcome of the evaluation is this: 
 

Offeror 
Experience, Expertise 

& Reliability 
(Maximum 30 Points) 

Proposed Method of 
Performance and 

Contractor Support 
 (Maximum 20 Points) 

Cost Points 
(Maximum 
50 Points) 

Total 
Score 

Turn Key 
Health Clinics 
LLC 

25 20 50 95 

Advanced 
Correctional 
Healthcare 

22 13 34 69 

 
The highest score is earned by Turn Key Health Clinics LLC.  As such, the proposal from Turn 
Key Health Clinics LLC is the “lowest and best” offer.  The Boone County Sheriff’s Office is 
recommending award to Turn Key Health Clinics LLC of Oklahoma City, Oklahoma, see 
attached e-mail dated 4/24/24 from Captain Damon Reynolds. 
 
The contract period will run from June 01, 2024 through May 31, 2025 with four (4) one-year 
renewal options available after this initial period.   
 
This is considered a Term and Supply contract for the Sheriff’s Office. A total $998,600.00 is 
budgeted for 2024. Payments will reference the following coding: 
  

• 1255 – General Fund Detention Operations/85620 – Other Medical 
 

 
/lp 
 
Attachments – E-Mail, Unacceptable Proposals Memo, Scoring Form, Evaluation Report, and 
Cost Evaluation 
 
 
cc:  Contract File  



TO: 

Boone County Purchasing 
Liz Palazzolo 
Senior Buyer 

5551 S. Tom Bass Road, Room 204 
Columbia, MO 65201 

Phone: (573) 886-4392 
Fax: (573) 886-4390 

MEMORANDUM 

FROM: 
Boone County Commission 
Liz Palazzolo, CPPO, C.P.M. 
April 25, 2024 DATE: 

RE: Award of Contract C000783 from RFP 05- I 3MAR24 for Detainee Medical 
Services for the Boone County Jail/Boone County Sheriff - Tem1 and Supply 

Purchasing requests approval of Contract C000783 that results from Request for Proposal 05-
l 3MAR24. Said RFP solicited proposals for Detainee Medical Services for the Boone County 
Jail. Four proposals and one "No bid" were received: 

( 1) Advanced Correctional Healthcare of Franklin, Tennessee 
(2) Turn Key Health Clinics LLC of Oklahoma City, Oklahoma 
(3) Vital Medical Services of Glendale, California 
( 4) Superior Blessings LLC of Columbia, Missouri 
(5) Southern Health Partners of Chattanooga, Tennessee (No Bid) 

The four proposals have been reviewed by an Evaluation Team that consists of the following 
personnel: Captain Damon Reynolds, Boone County Jail Administrator; Captain Brian Leer of 
the Boone County Sheriffs Office; Captain Jenny Atwell, Assistant Boone County Jail 
Administrator; and Leasa Quick, Budget Administrator for the Boone County Sheriffs Office. 
The Purchasing Department chaired two evaluations meetings with the Evaluation Team and 
conducted two rounds of negotiations. 

After the first evaluation meeting, the Evaluation Team decided to short-list and removed two 
proposals from consideration. The reasoning is documented in the attached memo. Advanced 
Correctional Healthcare and Turn Key Health Clinics LLC were invited to submit a first round of 
Best and Final Offers (BAFOs). These BAFOs were reviewed during the second Evaluation 
Team meeting which resulted in the decision to pursue a second BAFO with Tum Key Health 
Clinics LLC. The attached Evaluation Narrative describes the evaluation and scoring between 
Advanced Correctional Healthcare and Turn Key Health Clinics, LLC. 

Weighted evaluation was used to evaluate and score the two proposals: Experience, Expertise, 
and Reliability was worth a maximum score of 30 subjective points; and Method of Performance 
and Contractor Support was worth a maximum score of 20 subjective points. Cost points, worth a 
maximum 50 points, were computed by the Purchasing Department. 



The Scoring Form, Evaluation Narrative explaining the subjective scores, and the Cost Evaluation 
are attached to this memo. It is noted for the record that the Evaluation team scored subjective 
points, worth a maximum of 50 total points, without knowledge of cost point scores. 

The outcome of the evaluation is this: 

Experience, Expertise 
Proposed Method of 

Cost Points 
Performance and Total 

Offeror & Reliability 
Contractor Support 

(Maximum 
Score 

(Maximum 30 Points) 
(Maximum 20 Points) 

50 Points) 

Turn Key 
Health Clinics 25 20 50 95 
LLC 
Advanced 
Correctional 22 13 34 69 
Healthcare 

The highest score is earned by Turn Key Health Clinics LLC. As such, the proposal from Tum 
Key Health Clinics LLC is the " lowest and best" offer. The Boone County Sheriffs Office is 
recommending award to Tum Key Health Clinics LLC of Oklahoma City, Oklahoma, see 
attached e-mail dated 4/24/24 from Captain Damon Reynolds. 

The contract period will run from June 01 , 2024 through May 31, 2025 with four (4) one-year 
renewal options available after this initial period. 

This is considered a Term and Supply contract for the Sheriffs Office. A total $998,600.00 is 
budgeted for 2024. Payments will reference the following coding: 

• 125 5 - General Fund Detention Operations/85620 - Other Medical 

/ Ip 

Attachments - E-Mail, Unacceptable Proposals Memo, Scoring Form, Evaluation Report, and 
Cost Evaluation 

cc: Contract File 



Liz Palazzolo 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Damon Reynolds 
Wednesday, April 24, 2024 2:34 PM 
Liz Palazzolo; Jenny Atwell; Brian Leer; Leasa Quick 
RE: Final Scoring Form with Cost Points - RFP 05-13MAR24 - Detainee Medical Services 
for Jail 

We would recommend Turn Key receive the award. 

From: Liz Palazzolo <LPalazzolo@boonecountymo.org> 
Sent: Wednesday, April 24, 2024 2:28 PM 
To: Damon Reynolds <DReynolds@boonecountymo.org>; Jenny Atwell <JAtwell@boonecountymo.org>; Brian Leer 
<BLeer@boonecountymo.org>; Leasa Quick <LQuick@boonecountymo.org> 
Subject: Final Scoring Form with Cost Points - RFP 05-13MAR24 - Detainee Medical Services for Jail 

Good afternoon: Attached please find the final scoring form with Cost Points for the evaluation of the proposals for 
Detainee Medical Services received in response to RFP 05-13MAR24. The apparent highest scoring proposal is from 
Turn Key Health Clinics, LLC. As the "lowest and best" offeror, please confirm that the Boone County Sheriff's Office 
recommends award of the contract to Turn Key Health Clinics, LLC of Oklahoma City, Oklahoma. 

Liz Palazzolo - Senior Buyer 
Boone County Missouri Purchasing 
5551 S. Tom Bass Road 
Columbia, MO 65201 
Direct Phone: 573-886-4392 
/pi1/11:::::olo<il)boonccou 11 tl/fllO.org 
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TO: 
FROM: 
RE: 
DATE: 

MEMORANDUM 
File 
Liz Palazzolo 
RFP 05-13MAR24 for Detainee Medical Services for the Boone County Sheriff's Office 
4/12/2024 

This memo documents results of discussion with the Evaluation Team reviewing the four proposals 
received by the County in response to RFP 05-13MAR24 for Detainee Medical Services -Term & Supply. 
Four proposals were received: 

(1) Advanced Correctional Healthcare of Franklin, Tennessee 
(2) Turn Key Health Clinics, LLC of Oklahoma City, Oklahoma 
(3) Vital Medical Services, LLC of Glendale, California 
(4) Superior Blessings, LLC of Columbia, Missouri 

The proposals from Vital Medical Services and Superior Blessings were deemed unacceptable and were 
removed from further consideration for award. The reasons follow. 

Vital Medical Services: Vital Medical Services indicated that its proposal includes a $100,000.00 pool 
requirement (see Supplier Note from BoCoMoBids, item 5.1.1, and page 29 of proposal). RFP 05-
13MAR24 is clear that the County offers a $50,000.00 pool (RFP paragraphs 3.1.2(j), 3.1.2(k), 3.23.10, 
and 3.23.lO(d)). None of the references Vital Medical Services identified were for County Jails - they 
were for smaller police departments; the services were not comprehensive medical and mental health 
services. Vital Medical Services is based out of California . Most if not all of their references are in 
California. Services provided to references include pre-book screenings, forensic evidence collection, 
and communicable disease and exposure testing. None of the described services are for running a Jail 
medical office 24X7 as is required by RFP 05-13MAR24. A "Chief Medical Officer for Missouri 
Operations" is identified as a job category but there are no details about the person who would be hired 
to fill that position. This also indicates that there is no one currently working for Vital Medical Services 
who is performing as the Chief Medical Officer for Missouri Operations. In general, details about how 
medical services would be delivered are very generalized and not specific. The proposal was not lowest 
priced and since the vendor wants to double-the available pool, their $863,250.60 total should be raised 
$50,000.00 to acknowledge their inflated pool request resulting in a total of $913,250.60. Detail on 
personnel is scant. No personnel are named. There are no resumes or job descriptions except for one 
resume for Dr. Angelique Campen who is the National Chief Medical Officer. It's assumed that she 
would oversee the Chief Medical Officer for Missouri; she would have little to do with daily operations 
managing medical services at the Boone County Jail; whereas there is no name or resume for the Chief 
Medical Officer for Missouri who, it is assumed, would have more direct contact with daily operations at 
the Boone County Jail. The lack of detail, lack of relevant references, and contradiction about the pool 
fund prompted the Evaluation Team to determine the proposal from Vital Medical Services as being 
unacceptable for further consideration. 
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Superior Blessings LLC: There are several offers contained in this one proposal from Jennifer Feltner. 
See the attached chart to illustrate the 5 different options the County can consider for provision of 
Detainee Medical Services at the Boone County Jail ranging in pricing from $668,000.00/year to 
$736,000.00. Superior Blessings agrees to provide services as required in the RFP, but actual staffing 
plans are not detailed. Superior Blessings intends to hire existing medical services staff performing for 
the incumbent contractor. It's assumed that this means Superior Blessings intends to recruit and hire 
nursing staff currently employed by Advanced Correctional Healthcare, but there's no detail about how 
or when this will be accomplished. Much of the detail about staffing expertise that Superior Blessings 
brings is focused on Jennifer Feltner who is the owner and CEO of Superior Blessings. The proposal 
promises a cost-effective approach to managing the Jail's medical services that will save the County 
money, however it's not clear how this goal will be reached because the proposal lacks detail about 
performance methodology and staffing. No references are provided that speak to Superior Blessings' 
performance as a health care provider except for one home-care reference. Other references are from 
banking and loaning institutions. The organizational chart includes two people by name - Jennifer 
Feltner and Angelica Yager, VP of Ad min Operations. Crucial medical positions (RN, LPN, Psychologist, 
Nurse Practitioner, the Pharmacy) have no one identified. There are few job descriptions for any of the 
essential medical positions. Much material in the proposal is directly copied from other resources 
(Sacramento County for example). There are references in the proposal to serving the Jail "and the 
Juvenile facility." RFP requirements do not include provision of medical services at the juvenile facility. 
Nothing further was said in the proposal about extension of service to the juvenile facility. Because of 
the lack of appreciable detail about staff, staff expertise, experience running a Jail medical office 24X7, 
and detail about how services would be performed, the Evaluation team concluded that the proposal 
from Superior Blessings didn't meet the threshold for continued evaluation. 
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Superior Blessing Option 1 Superior Blessing Option 2 Superior Blessing Option 3 Superior Blessing Option 4 Superior Blessing Option 5 

1) Nurse Practitioner - lNP 2 hours/week; Part Time; 1) Nurse Practitioner - lNP 2 hours/week; Pa rt Time; 1) Nurse Practitioner - lNP 2 hours/week; Part Time; 

On-Ca ll 24X7X365 On-Call 24X7X365 On-Call 24X7X365 
1) Nurse Practitioner - 1 NP 2 hours/week; Part Time; 1) Nurse Practitioner -lNP 2 hours/week; Part Time; 1 

2) LPN -2 LPNs Full Time (36 hours each) and 1 LPN Part 2) RN -1 RN Part Time; 12 hours/week 2) RN -1 RN Part Time; 12 hours/week 
On-Call 24X7X365 NP - On-Call 24X7X365 

Time, (12 hours/week each) 3) LPN -3 LPNs Fu ll Time (36 hours each) and 1 LPN Part 3) LPN -2 LPNs Full Ti me (36 hours each) and 1 LPN Part 
2) RN - 1 RN, Part & Full Time; 36 hours/week 2) LPN -4 Full Time (36 hours each) and 2 Part Time, (12 

3) Certified Medication Technicia n -2 CMTs Full Time Time, (12 hours/week each) Time, (12 hours/week each) 
3) LPN - 3 LPN's Full Time; (36 hours/week each) hours/week each) 

(36 hours/week each) and 2 CMT' s Part Time (12 4) Certified Med ication Technician -1 CMT Full Time (36 4) Certi fi ed Medication Technician -2 CMTs Full Ti me 
4) QMHP - 1 QMHP Ful l Time; 40 hours/week 3) QMHP - 1 QMHP Full Time;40 hours/week 

hours/week each) hours/week each) (36 hours/week each ) 
5) Discha rge Planner- lDP, Part Time; 20 hours/week 4) Discharge Planner -1 DP Part Time; 20 hours/week 

4) QMHP - 1 QMHP Full Time;40 hours/week 5) QMHP - 1 QMHP Full Time;40 hours/week 5) QMHP - 1 QMHP Fu ll Time;40 hours/week 

5) Discharge Planner -1 DP Part Time; 20 hours/week 6) Discharge Planner-1 DP Part Time; 20 hours/week 6) Discharge Planner -1 DP Part Time; 20 hours/week 

$ 736,000.00 $ 702,000.00 $ 675,000.00 $ 688,000.00 $ 668,000.00 

Enhancement Options include Telehealth option for Enha ncement Options include Telehealth option for Enhancement Options include Telehealth option for Enhancement Options include Tele hea lth option for Enha ncement Options include Telehealth option for 

QMHP: $150/hou r QMHP: $150/hour QMHP: $150/hour QMHP: $150/hour QMHP: $150/hour 

Yoga Instructor: $20,000 annua l Yoga Instructor: $20,000 annual Yoga Instructor: $20,000 annual Yoga Instructor: $20,000 annual Yoga Instructor: $20,000 annual 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 5F245141-FFD2-4EDB-8AE2-AF440BC483F8 

1 

2 

3 

4 

EVALUATION SCORING FORM 
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT - BOONE COUNTY - MISSOURI 

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL 05-13MAR24 - Detainee Medical Services for the Boone County Jail - Term & Supply 

For Purchasing Use Only 

Experience, Method of 
TOTAL SUBJECTIVE 

NAME OF OFFEROR 
Expertise, & Performance & 

POINTS 
COST POINTS TOTAL POINTS 

Reliability Contractor Support 
(50 points) 

(50 points) (Max 100 points) 
30 Maximum 20 Maximum 

Advanced Correctional 
22 13 35 .J1 (oct Healthcare 

Turn Key Health Clinics, 
25 20 45 5 Z> ~5 LLC 

Superior Blessings Unacceptable See File Memo 

Vital Medical Services, 
Unacceptable See File Memo 

LLC 

We hereby attest that the subjective points assigned to each offeror above were scored pursuant to the established evaluation criteria and 
represent our best judgement of the subjective areas of the offerors' proposals. We have attached a brief narrative which highlights some, but 
not necessarily all, of the reasons for our evaluation of the proposals as indicated by the scores above. Our comments represent our opinions 
only and do not represent the position of the Purchasing Department of Boone County, Missouri, or any other party. 

DocuSlgned by: 

Evaluation Scoring Form 

Damon Reynolds 

Evaluator Printed Name 

Brian Leer 

Evaluator Printed Name 

Jenny Atwell 

Evaluator Printed Name 
Leasa Quick 

Evaluator Printed Name 

Jail Administrator 

Title 

captain 

Title 

Boone County Sheriff's Office 

Dept. 

Boone County Sheriff's Office 

Dept. 

Assistant Jail Administrator 
Boone County Sheriff's Office 

Title Dept. 
Budget Administrator 

Boone County Sheriff's Office 

Title Dept. 
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Evaluation Report RFP 05-13MAR24 -Detainee Medical Services for the Boone County Jail - Term & 
Supply 

I OFFEROR #1: Turn Key Health Clinics LLC 

• The proposal from Tum Key Health Clinics LLC is deemed responsive to the mandatory terms and 
conditions of the RFP. 

EXPERIENCE, EXPERTISE and RELIABILITY: SCORE 25 of30 

Strengths: 
• Been in operation 15 years (since 2009); 
• Serves more than 100 correctional facilities in the Central US, several counties in Missouri (Buchanan, 

Christian, Franklin, and Pettis). Bringing Cole County into the service network in April 2024; 
• Experienced with NCCHC and ACA accreditation standards as well as DOJ mandates. Operate in 

accordance with NCCHC and ACA standards; 
• Lead officers maintain Certified Correctional Health Professional status with NCCHC; 
• Long history/experience providing correctional healthcare (140 years collectively leadership team) 
• Low litigation history - shared details; 
• Contacted three Missouri references (Buchanan County, Pettis County, and Christian County) and 2 out­

of-state references (Logan County, OK and Saline County, AR). All references spoke highly about Turn 
Key Health Clinics, and indicated their Jail facilities medical offices had improved under Tum Key 
Tum Key is responsive, provides required staffing and is a good contractor and support to their jails; 

• References are jails like Boone County jail; 
• Experienced administrative and medical staff - very familiar with working in a correctional 

environment. 

Concerns: 
• None 

METHOD OF PERFORMANCE and CONTRACTOR SUPPORT: SCORE 20 of 20 

Strengths: 
• Mid-level practitioner-is on-call 24X7 plus on the weekly staff schedule for 4 hours on Fridays; 
• Nursing includes RN's and LPN's; 
• Providing Detox training and Sheriff staff training at no additional costs including no cost for materials 

and supplies with reasonable advance notice for training; 
• Provide daily operations reports - this would be new and beneficial; 
• Pharmacy management process provides prescription oversight; 
• Screen for inmate ' s private insurance as well as Medicaid/Medicare coverage at intake; 
• An initial comprehensive mental health assessment will be conducted within 14-days after intake; 
• Will perform initial evaluation of all detainees within 4-hours of arrival at the Jail, and a comprehensive 

health assessment in 14-days. 
• Plan to check routinely on inmates with chronic conditions; 
• Plan to deliver most care on-site or through mobile service - eliminate barriers to exchanging 

information with local hospitals and care providers. Routine medical specialty services (lab, x-ray, 
EKG, ultrasound) to be performed on-site when feasible, and will identify as many specialist providers 
willing to conduct on-site clinics; 



• Drug policy kept on-site in Charge Nurse's office - provided copy of policy in proposal; 
• Medical cost containment plan is patient-oriented that ties into discharge planning for inmates needing 

mental health services; 
• Pharmaceuticals cost containment will follow direction of Boone County Jail retaining IHS or shifting to 

Diamond Pharmacy - will adhere to NCCHC and ACA standards; 
• Will implement a site-level Continuous Quality Improvement (CQI) Committee to identify healthcare 

problems and how to correct in adherence with NCCHC and ACA standards; 
• Tum Key provides 2-hours of psychiatry service per week; 
• Will implement a Client-Liaison program for the Boone County Jail. Client liaison will be focused on 

service delivery and meeting performance and contract expectations. 

Concerns: 
• None 

I OFFEROR #2: Advanced Correctional Healthcare 

• The proposal from Advanced Correctional Healthcare is deemed responsive to the mandatory terms and 
conditions of the RFP. 

EXPERIENCE, EXPERTISE and RELIABILITY: SCORE 22 of30 

Strengths: 
• Been in operation 22 years (since 2002); 
• Have served Missouri since 2005; 
• ACH has served the Boone County Jail since June of 2016; 
• Deliver servicers that may be audited against ACA and NCCHC standards; 
• Provided supportive references from Missouri (Jackson County and Phelps County) and letter of support 

from Genessee County (MI) Jail; 
• Experienced professional staff familiar with working in correctional environment; 
• ACH's current nursing staff is excellent to work with; 
• Included workplace drug policy in proposal - says it applies to subcontractors too. 

Concerns: 
• Does not routinely meet contractual nursing staffing requirements under current contract; 
• Jail staff has to fill-in when ACH staffing levels are not met; 
• Several of Tum Key Health Clinic LLC's references were previous ACH clients who had switched to 

Tum Key Health Clinic primarily because of unexpected requests from ACH for cost increases and 
staffing that failed to meet required levels, in other words, for experience similar to that of the Boone 
County Jail with ACH. 

• Lawsuit details were not disclosed without the County signing a Non-Disclosure Agreement. 
• Has not performed annual audit as required in the current contract with Boone County. 

METHOD OF PERFORMANCE and CONTRACTOR SUPPORT: SCORE 13 of 20 

Strengths: 
• Medical personnel (nursing staff) will be proficient, skilled and familiar with working in the Boone 

County Jail since ACH is the incumbent contractor; 



• ACH allows practitioners to operate without restriction on medical care delivered to inmate; 
• ACH allows economies of scale to help reduce the costs of medical care and keep the inmate healthy; 
• Strong relationship with national pharmaceutical companies that allows ACH to pass cost savings on to 

Boone County; 
• Has detailed Quality Control and Tracking Process with reporting. Does monthly CQI meetings with 

Jail. 
• Will provide CPR training for 50 officers including CPR cards per year. 

Concerns: 
• Bill scrubbing is currently done free of charge. ACH requests $17 /claim only if there is a savings under 

a new contract; 
• Only going to use RN's to meet nursing staffing. Question ACH does not address is where current LPN 

staff is used or placed if not serving at the jail; 
• Practitioner hours are less than Tum Keys, i.e. 2 hours compared to 4 hours; 
• ACH initially took exception to providing 24X7 on-call mental health service. The BAFO #1 response 

says the County can contact "the practitioner" that is on call 24X7. The response is still ambiguous 
because this can be read to be the medical practitioner, not the mental health practitioner. It is not clear 
like it should be that the mental health practitioner is on call 24X7. 

• ACH indicates it will meet the required Qualified Mental Health Professional (QMHP) services 
requirement however under the current contract, ACH does not meet the level of service required for 
QMHP coverage. 

SUMMARY: 

Tum Key Health Clinics LLC presented a strong proposal. Tum Key is scored 25 of 30 points in the area of 
Experience, Reliability and Contractor support. Tum Key follows National Commission on Correctional Health 
Care (NCCHC) and American C01Tectional Association (ACA) standards; administrative and professional staff 
are certified. All references contacted said the same things about Tum Key Health Clinics - the company is 
good to work with, meet staffing requirements, and are a good partner. All references indicated they would 
choose Tum Key again to run their jail medical services. Tum Key says they pride themselves on their 
transparency. They provided detail about lawsuits in their proposal. Their proposal for Method of Performance 
scored 20 out of 20 maximum points. Tum Key offers 4 hours on-site staffing for their mid-level practitioner 
and will use a combination of RN's and LPN's to meet required 24X7 nursing service levels. They offer 
continuous quality improvement with the addition of daily reporting to the Sheriff which is an additional 
benefit. Tum Key will conduct a comprehensive mental health evaluation within 14 days of intake and with on­
going mental health care oversight through release. Tum Key says it will cultivate relationships and 
communicate with local health and mental health services providers to ensure cost reductions while the inmate 
is at the jail and forge a pathway to on-going care after the inmate's release. A unique benefit Tum Key offers is 
the Client Liaison who will be assigned to the Boone County Jail and will focus on meeting Tum Key's 
contractual performance expectations. 

Advanced Correctional Healthcare is a reputable firm that has been the County's medical services provider at 
the Jail for several years. Nursing staff has been excellent to work with. Advanced Correctional Healthcare is 
scored 22 of 30 points in the area of Experience, Reliability and Contractor support. Advanced Correctional 
Healthcare (ACH) loses points because the Boone County Jail has experienced instances where nursing staff 
has not been at contracted levels, at times causing jail staff to take-up the slack to cover the absence. While 
ACH provides a credit for staffing not meeting agreed-to levels, it would be preferred that staffing levels were 
met. Additionally, it was concerning to hear several jails that had shifted away from ACH for reasons similar to 
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Boone County's experience with ACH, i.e., ACH wanted additional funding and otherwise failed to meet 
committed levels of staffing. ACH initially proposed to use County pool funds to cover more items and 
services that ACH currently covers; this was corrected by ACH in its BAFO # 1 response, but it still leaves a 
negative impression. Additionally, ACH would not disclose its lawsuits history without the County signing an 
NDA whereas Tum Key provided detail in its proposal about its lawsuits history as requested in the RFP. ACH 
is scored 13 out of a maximum 20 points for Method of Performance. In comparison to Tum Key ACH offers 
half the number of weekly scheduled mid-level practitioner hours. ACH is no longer planning to employ LPN 
staff instead proposing to use RN's for all nursing services delivered at the jail; this leaves the question about 
what happens to current LPN staff who perform well for the jail. Tum Key has a 24X7 on-call list for the 
physician, psychiatrist and licensed mental health counselor whereas ACH's 24X7 coverage on mental health 
service is not described as clearly ensuring coverage and access as needed. ACH fails to meet the requirement 
in the current contract regarding Qualified Mental Health Professional services and the Sheriff's office is 
concerned that ACH will not meet the requirement under a new contract. The Sheriff's Office has not received 
an annual audit from ACH regarding its performance under the current contract as required, causing concern 
about provision of the required audit under a new contract. All things considered, the proposal from Tum Key 
Health Clinics compared to the proposal from Advanced Correctional Healthcare presents a better overall 
opportunity for the County to staff and manage detainee medical services. 



RFP 05-13MAR24 • Detainee Medical 

Services 

Orig inal Contract Period -Total Annua l 

Price - 184 Detainee ADP 

Per Diem Per Detainee ADP Adjustment -

applied when ADP is above or below 184 

Renewal Adjustments , .. ----- . - -

1st Renewa l Period 

2nd Renewal Period 

3rd Renewa l Period 

4th Renewal Period 

Turn Key Health Clinics LLC 
Original Contract Period 

840,847 .30 

o.75 I s 

3.7% 

3.7% 

3.7% , 

3.7% ' 

COST EVALUT/ON RFP 05-13MAR24 DETAINEE MEDICAL SERVICES 

Turn Key Health Clinics LLC 

First Renewal Contract Period 

87 1,958.65 

o.78 I $ 

Turn Key Health Clinics LLC 
Second Renewal Contract Period 

904,221.12 

0.81 I $ 

Turn Key Health Clinics LLC 

Third Renewal Contract Period 
Turn Key Health Clinics LLC 

Fourth Renewal Contract Period 

937,677.30 972,371.36 

o.84 I $ 

'To1:al ·su~ Per Annum Added to ADP 
Adjustment - All 5 Contract Periods 

o.87 I $ 

$ 

GRAND TOTAL COST 

Turn Key Health Clinics LLC 

4,527,075.73 

4.04 

4,527,079.77 



RFP 0S-13MAR24 - Detainee Medical 

Services 

Orig inal Contract Period -Total Annual 

Price - 184 Detainee ADP 

Per Diem Per Detainee ADP Adjustment -

app lied when ADP is above or below 184 

Renewal Adjustments 

1st Renewal Period 

2nd Renewa l Peri od 

3rd Renewal Period 

4th Renewal Period 

Advanced Correctional Healthcare 

Original Contract Period 

1,204,122.00 

o.s1 I s 

4.52% 

4.52% 

4.52% 

4.52% , 

COST EVALUTION RFP 05-13MAR24 DETAINEE MEDICAL SERVICES 

Advanced Correctional Healthcare 

First Renewal Contract Period 

1,258,548.31 

Advanced Correctional Healthcare Advanced Correctional Healthcare 

Second Renewal Contract Period Third Renewal Contract Period 

1,315,434 .10 I s 1,374,s92.3s 

Advanced Correctional Healthcare 

Fourth Renewal Contract Period 

1,437,037.48 

o.91 I $ o.9s I $ o.99 I $ 1.04 I s 

Total Sum Per Annum Added to ADP 

Adjustment - All 5 Contract Periods 

GRANO TOTAL COST 

Advanced Correctional Healthcare 

6,590,034.84 

4.76 

6,590,039.60 



Original Contract Period 1st Renewal 2nd Renewal 3rd Renewal 4th Renewal TOTAL COST ALL CONTRACT PERIODS 

RFP 0S-13MAR24 - Advanced Correctional Turn Key Health Clinics LLC Advanced Correctional Turn Key Health Clinics LLC Advanced Correctional Turn Key Health Clinics LLC Advanced Correctional Turn Key Health Clinics LLC Advanced Correctional Turn Key Health Clinics LLC Advanced Correctional TurnKey Health Clinics LLC 
Detainee Medical Health Care Health Care Health Care Health Care Health care Health Care 
Services 

Original Contract $ 1,204,122.00 $ 840,847.30 $ 1,258,548.31 $ 871,958.65 $ 1,315,434.70 $ 904,221.12 $ 1,374,892.35 $ 937,677.30 $ 1,437,037.48 $ 972,371.36 $ 6,590,034.84 $ 4,527,075.73 
Perid -Total Annual 

Price - 184 Detainee 

ADP 

Per Diem Pe r $ 0.87 s 0.75 s 0.91 $ 0.78 $ 0.95 $ 0.81 $ 0.99 $ 0.84 s 1.04 s 0.87 s 4.76 $ 4.04 
Detainee ADP 

Adjustment - applied 

when ADP is above or 

below 184 

TOTAL PRICE FOR COST POINTS EVALUATION $ 6,S90,039.60 $ 4,527,079.77 

·- -·-. ------- -- ---~-- , - - --·- - -- -~ •- ------ ~-·- --- -- ... - - --- -- -- - - --·- - --- -·--··- -
COST POINTS: (LOWEST TOTAL PRICE/COMPARED TOTAL PRICE) X's 50 MAXIMUM 34 50 

COST POINTS 
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